
W,g7#1147-636 

' 

-Trirs  
Reny  cik 

Wit:4 TRWIT rgl'a SNiteRt 

wirtin 

wramt 
crpT-1, 9,1 (EF) 
(4,1,5fisT TrfariziTo 

WeRF., liTAIT, 29 faffr4% 2000 

9, 1922 triaiE fftWi 

797 saw littinit 

Rurd 9x-putr--1 

46A1 292 7i6a0T-1-1 (10) 20-1999 
FITT/WM, 29 fterEft, 2000 

lege:WWI 

• 

Tata 	 • 

19av cicT tiretkirf" trylic 201 W1TUW trs-viti 4rtiTtr 479v stvr ftti-r4 wn 	tj grin 
arse sr cot tun WaW W-661 TieF01) filiTIT, 1999 'It f66116 5 fla's“, 2O00 T6') VITA ST6TW 
ef SAT 6Z Wet sew crfsftzr ttoi 36 %I 200 * WiT acitimitur Ter ft(*fist R Wf9er41 
MT sisfarg f461 WRIT 

srftmlit,..4tur (reit, 	 Trea..,r) RfiTfrt-rgir 1999 

0397 srav Qrafkarif ;•:317 36 fr4, 2000) 

NM Wet sa6T i6QT9 rireff UTWI WIFT3 pi] 

set Tikir 4 stra sletIV 	#49 	VfIT1ifor, 1973 E61 Wirde 
cc74.  fFtt 

Trite4E17 

‘1031 	 5*.  TErre zot 4 f9;74flifrau ifafmrc q4rcrt wart •:- 

1— (1) tr! vftrromc 	srfgrar vifor (3b-7 sravr Tivrivr4) ssfirfkrisr, 	rifrimr vr-4, 
1 999 WV EMPTY 1 	 •• 

(2) Zet51 fati. 	'T Aitit eriii 	 ATITict 

( 3) sq Q41" •ketvi ;a) srivr (MT it1T 2IWW atiVri 15Trtar661 inT We fella' 
fella qt 1; 



2 	 grit, STivt 	W tY9E, 29 fert9T: 2000 

, 	urtfetTquar 2 
KR 1974 thet 
soli 125 eTT 
#etre.  

• 

1•••• 

2—fl attl iittaTi 1913 'ft; I99 ge91949 Itar ;Mt ti  
MT 1 25 fire 

(q) agEtra (1) 4 PM `!qti 91.  70" Fim qt ri `f,cal pR 
via" va WI atilt 

(a) aaaRT is) 	qttafft, farafaftaa 	ra ri 4't 
Dick 	 • 

"o) eqt '47WIU ?t," WEItt9 f91 Ti4EfTerk 91:94E t zr-Q 
gala 0 fa smut-tea cfaq arm T4ai 	 t csrrara 

fag alt tartlare 	atrattew attri faq MffEr 'XIV 41 
aravraar tt Oa* au* suita tfT Ear balka tO, rata fan 
svta-0aer fag 4Tqf fkInt 	t, gray t EA-4T fair 94 Vtiglit 

91;99 ke eftlff R19 VITT wit' 4 wafer* ter srrfaa war - 
11Yt IDTI11110 EVA' Nra 4a7 Tfratqc /1.1Efegia.  Erste, ara-alaa 
k fait arat tatk eta Feee W-1 tieW 	Alt fft 	sitre-zr/WW 

inkr rt,•1 	siadal-e jtirT t" 

WV 127 ail 	3a VI airEfrizfr( UM 121 4, mint ( 4, cit Jta. 4 WK If" 

Sialltre 	tirl stein  tR Etre 	SM 'feta qrp: *14" Ta.  1W, 

inn 4; 

- 	rave, 
altar alga t 

.J 

No. 2927 (2)/XV1I-v-1-1 (KA) 20-1999 ' 

Dated Lucknow, December 29, 2000 

IN pursuance of the Provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, 
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of 
the Da nd Praltriya Samhita (Uttar Pradesh Unshod han) Adbiniyam, 1999 (Uttar Pradesh 
Adhiniyam Sankhyn 36 of 2000) as passed by the utter Pradesh Legislature and assented 
to by the President on December 5,2000 :— 

THE CODE OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE (UTTAR PRADESH 
AMENDMENT) ACT, 1999 

(C. P. ACT NO. 36 oF 2000) 

(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature) 

AN 
ACT 

further to amend the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 in its app!!- 
ii • 
pi:t1 	 cation to Uttar Pradesh. 

, 	 Ir is HEREBY enacted in the Fiftieth Year of the Republic of India as 

ft 	 follows 

Short title, 	 1. (I) This Act may be called the Code of Criminal Procedure (Uttar 
extent and 	Pradesh Amendment) Act, 1999. 
commencement 

(2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh. 

It shall come into force OD Such date as the State Government 
may, by notification, appoint in this behalf. 

Amendment of 
soatieg 125 of 
Act tro. 2 of 1974 

2. 	in section 125 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, herein- 
after referred to as the principal Act,— • . 

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "five hundred rupees" the 
words "five thousand rupees" Shall be substituted ; 

a 

• 



3ttt Sital gruTtT ritTi 29 ftura, 20 00 

,flison.... ......aussreeendsoefiamairs..n....i 	4A 	M. 

(b) after sub-section (5), the following. sub-section shall be• 

inserted, namely :— 
. 64(6) Where in a proceeding under this section it appears to 

the magistrate that the person claiming maintenance is in need 
of immediate relief for his support and the necessary expenses of 
the proceeding, the Magistrate may, on his application, order the 
person against whom the maintenance is claimed, to pay to the 
person claiming the maintenance, during the pendency of the 
proceeding such monthly allowance not exceeding five thousand 
rupees and sucli expenses of the Proceeding as the magistrate 
consider reasonable and such order shall be enforceable as an 

. order of ntaintenanct. 	 te• 

3. 	In section 127 of the principal Aot, sub.seetion (1), in the 

proviso for the words "five hundred rupees" The words "five thousand 

rupees" shall be substituted. • 
BY order, 

V. R. TRIMTHI, 
Pransukh Stich:v. 

Amendment 61 
notion 121 

±kr.: 

glottercalottil o—R o as 1 76:11 0 falat 9--(497 3) —2 0 01.,_. s 5in (Tier 9) 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003

